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Masonry Work  $122,000

1 Sullivan & Narey Y Y Y Y Y 66,310.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       None Listed

2 Cantarella & Son Y Y Y Y Y 50,500.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       None Listed

3 Marmelo Bros NO BID

4 Fernandes Masonry NO BID

5 The Waterproofing Co. NO BID

6 Chabot & Burnett NO BID

7 L&L Masonry NO BID

Misc Metals $ 635,000

1 United Steel NO BID

2 EDM Construction NO BID

Waterproofing $135,000

1 Armani Restoration Y Y Y N Y 98,865.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

2 Chapman Waterproofing Y Y Y Y Y 173,350.00$    -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

3 East Coast Air Barrier Y Y Y Y Y 173,433.00$    -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

4

Superior Caulking & 

Waterproofing Y Y Y Y Y 157,800.00$    NC NC NC NC NONE LISTED
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5 PJ Spillane Y Y Y Y Y 219,000.00$    -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

6 The Waterproofing Co., Inc y y y y y 152,200.00$    -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

Roofing & Flashing $30,000

1 JD Rivet y y y y y 40,650.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

2 Rockwell Roofing y y y y y 44,375.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

3 Greenwood Industries No Bid

Painting $25,000

1 Northeast Painting NO BID

2 Keltic Painting Y Y Y Y Y 48,700.00$      NC NC NC NC NONE LISTED

3 John Eagan Y Y Y Y Y 42,200.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

4 King Painting Y Y Y Y Y 34,900.00$      NC NC NC NC NONE LISTED

Plumbing $133,800

1 B&G Mechanical NO BID

2 Boulanger's Plumbing Y Y Y Y Y 132,500.00$    -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

3

Dobert Heating & Air 

Conditioning 208,000.00$    NONE LISTED

4 Edward Corcoran P&H 152,200.00$    NONE LISTED

5 Harold Bros Mech. NO BID

6 Adams P&H NO BID

7 Araujo Bros Plumbing 149,800.00$    NONE LISTED
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HVAC $25,000

1 Boulanger Plumbing NO BID

2 Edward F Corcoran P&H Y Y Y Y Y 21,000.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LISTED

3 B&G Mechanical NO BID

4 General Mech NO BID

5 Adams P&H NO BID

6 Dobbert Heating & AC Y Y Y Y Y 24,000.00$      -$      -$        -$                  -$       NONE LSITED

7 Harold Bros Mech NO BID

Electrical $294,000

1 Amp Electrical Y Y Y Y Y 283,000.00$    -$      -$        7,000.00$        -$       NONE LSITED

2 Comalli Inc. Y Y Y Y Y 289,700.00$    -$      -$        12,710.00$      -$       NONE LSITED

3 Wayne J Griffin Electric Y Y Y Y Y 288,000.00$    -$      -$        13,500.00$      -$       NONE LSITED

4 Gable Electric Y Y Y Y Y 229,000.00$    -$      -$        14,500.00$      NONE LSITED

5 Universal Electric Y Y Y Y Y 292,385.00$    -$      -$        11,550.00$      -$       NONE LSITED


